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PREFACE 

In front of you is the seventh Student Paper Collection from a prize competition or-
ganised by the Svetlana Djurdjević Lukić Fund. With this initiative, the Public Policy 
Research Centre (“PPRC”) pays tribute to Svetlana Djurdjević Lukić, a human secu-
rity expert and the PPRC co-founder, who has left a lasting mark in the area of public 
(security) policies. Svetlana Djurdjević Lukić (1963-2016) devoted her life to human 
security research and advocacy, aiming to understand and address the key challeng-
es facing our society. Her dedicated work and efforts have left a profound imprint on 
security policies research. The prize competition is an opportunity for research on the 
subject of human security. Following in the footsteps of Svetlana Djurdjević Lukić, 
our aim is to motivate young authors to engage in research on security. 

This year’s competition focuses on four key areas that represent the current chal-
lenges facing our society. Each of the topics aims to stimulate thought, research and 
action in the area of human security. In the wake of the immense tragedy at the 
Vladislav Ribnikar Primary School, we steered the competition towards the under-
standing and research of peer violence, gender-based violence, small arms and safe-
ty in schools. This year’s Student Paper Collection includes three papers that prob-
lematize these topics. 

In her paper entitled Where is the Intersection of Femicide and the Concept of Human 
Security in Serbia?, Milica Otović, an undergraduate student at the University of Bel-
grade Faculty of Security Studies, seeks to understand the concept of femicide from 
a human security perspective. By analysing secondary material, the author establish-
es connection between (mis)use of small arms and violence against women, arguing 
that the issue of violence against women primarily relates to the established unwant-
ed behaviour patterns and that only a shift in the social narrative and perspective can 
raise awareness about this issue. 

Tijana Bauer, a master’s student at Ca' Foscari University of Venice, focuses on a 
similar subject in her paper entitled Gender Aspect of Security: The Role of Small 
Arms in Femicide. The author provides an overview of statistical data on femicide, 
linking it to the cult of small arms possession and misuse in Serbia. In addition to the 
evident risk related to these weapons, the author argues that there is a deep cultural 
link between the cult of the gun and the notion of a woman as a man’s property. The 
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weak institutional frameworks governing these issues, as well as the way in which 
the media inform society about such cases, upholding the tradition of patriarchy fur-
ther, are also identified. 

Maintaining School Safety after Misuse of Firearms: Evaluation of Action Taken af-
ter a Mass Killing at a Primary School in Belgrade is the title of the paper written by 
Kristina Bosilj, a master’s student at The London School of Economics and Political 
Science and the winner of the last year’s prize competition. The paper takes the form 
of a policy brief aiming to promote human security. It analyses the actions taken af-
ter the mass killing at the Vladislav Ribnikar Primary School, focusing on the media 
impact and the disarmament issue. The author emphasises the many effects of media 
violence and suggests ways in which coverage of similar contents could be regulat-
ed. Regarding disarmament, the author acknowledges the social significance of the 
issue, in view of the proliferation of weapons in Serbia, and proposes a model for im-
proving school safety through the implementation of technical security measures and 
a zero-tolerance violence policy.

The prize competition of the Svetlana Djurdjević Lukić Fund is more than an oppor-
tunity to gain recognition. It is an opportunity to impact change in society and poli-
cies through research. For that reason, we have encouraged undergraduate, specialist, 
master’s and PhD students to submit papers and demonstrate their potential for sev-
en years in a row. This is the seventh collection of students’ papers published by the 
PPRC within the scope of activities of the Svetlana Djurdjević Lukić Fund and with 
the support of the Democratisation Department of the OSCE Mission to Serbia. We 
want to extend thanks to the OSCE Mission to Serbia that has given us continuous 
support and recognised the importance of encouraging students to develop their aca-
demic skills, take critical approach and gain insights into key threats to human secu-
rity. The PPRC also wants to thank the jury, including Vladimir Bilandžić, PhD, Van-
ja Rokvić, PhD and Srdjan Korać, PhD.

Belgrade, December 2023 

Svetlana Djurdjević Lukić Fund 
Filip Stojanović
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WHERE IS THE INTERSECTION OF FEMICIDE 
AND THE CONCEPT OF HUMAN SECURITY IN 
SERBIA?

Milica OTOVIĆ*, undergraduate student  
University of Belgrade Faculty of Security Studies

Abstract: It took over three decades for the concept of femicide to gain recognition 
in the Serbian discourse. Initially, understanding the term was challenging, but to-
day it is increasingly discussed and presented in the media and everyday conversa-
tions due to the prevalence of this phenomenon. The social structure and narrative, 
i.e. the social perception of femicide, plays a crucial role in understanding and po-
sitioning femicide in Serbia. The existence of violence, which femicide de facto is, is 
just one of the threats undermining human security. In analysing the high femicide 
rate in Serbia, reports of killings were considered, relevant risk factors were identi-
fied and a comparative data analysis was conducted. The presence and accessibili-
ty of firearms and their misuse in violence against women pose an additional threat, 
increasing the likelihood of fatal outcomes of violence. The issue of violence against 
women primarily concerns the established unwanted behaviour patterns. It is only 
the shift in the social narrative and perspective that can raise awareness about this 
issue and support the efforts of relevant authorities and professionals responsible for 
ensuring the individual and community safety.

Key words: femicide, violence, human security, gender equality, social narrative 

	  *milicaotovic01@gmail.com 
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Femicide as a Phenomenon 

The term ‘femicide’ has only recently emerged in the public sphere, but it is still pre-
dominantly used within academic circles. In the media or everyday speech, alter-
native phrases with neutral or male-centric connotations are used to describe this 
concept. Examples include ‘fatal shootings of women’, ‘the killing of women, ‘vic-
timisation of women killings’ or even ‘manslaughter’ (Halilović, 2022:7). In various 
societies worldwide, femicide is also recognized as ‘dowry death’ (India) and ‘hon-
our killing’ (Pakistan), ‘partner or spousal violence’, ‘murder with rape’, ‘the killing 
of prostitutes’, ‘female infanticide’ or ‘selective abortion’. Femicide also encompass-
es other deaths that, as indicated by forensic reports, result from women or girls be-
ing specifically targeted due to their sex (Milković, 2022:7 as cited in Laurent, 2013). 
A more recent definition of femicide is not limited to a strictly feminist perspective 
as it departs from the fact that “femicide is any killing of a female person” (Geneva 
Declaration Secretariat, 2008:2). Although femicide was not totally overlooked in the 
past, it had a different meaning in everyday discourse and was treated as just another 
gender-sensitive issue, which led to its romanticisation at some point.

Namely, as stated by Majda Halilović in the Atlantic Initiative Newsletter, femicide 
is a killing, but its main characteristic is that it is a gender-based killing resulting 
from gender-based violence (Halilović at al, 2022). In Serbia, femicide is still con-
sidered to be an extreme form of domestic violence, while its gender-related dimen-
sion, as the other side of this phenomenon, remains overshadowed. The International 
Human Rights System, on the other hand, has long put emphasis on the link between 
gender-based discrimination and gender-based violence, seeking to reduce and elim-
inate these phenomena as much as possible, as they are “a threat to human security", 
as argued by Kadribašić in the Newsletter (2022:22). 

The Intersection of Human Security and Femicide 

Shortly before the United Nations Development Programme (UNDP) first promot-
ed the concept of human security in its annual Human Development Report 1994 
(UNDP, 1994), Diana Russell, the originator of the term ‘femicide’, had brought at-
tention to this 19th-century term that had previously fallen out of wider use by the 
public (2008). This term could be heard in Diana Russell’s presentation at the Inter-
national Tribunal on Crimes against Women in Brussels, but could not be specifical-
ly and precisely defined (1977). Russell later redefined femicide as “the killing of 
females by males because they are female” (2008:26). Owing to her, this term has be-
come a symbol of the ongoing struggle to liberate women from violence. 
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Violence is an important issue of human security and can be viewed as a distinct al-
ternative to human security, as it impacts individuals at a personal level, arises from 
social relations and affects freedom from fear, scarcity and dignity (n.d.). Just like 
there is no universally accepted and agreed-upon definition of violence, there is also 
no generally accepted definition of femicide. However, research into violence over 
the past few decades has transitioned from a reductionist approach, which mainly un-
derstands violence in terms of physical injury, to a more comprehensive approach in-
volving different manifestations of violence – direct and indirect, interpersonal and 
structural, physical, emotional, economic and others (n.d.). These steps have helped 
to explain femicide as one of the extreme forms of violence, securing it a place in the 
human security concept.

The existence of violence in any form is just one element that jeopardises human se-
curity. Human security in turn encompasses a much broader spectrum of factors that 
contribute to personal security, such as “respect for human rights, good governance, 
access to education and health care services, and the creation of conditions where 
every individual has the possibility to choose their own path and fulfil their poten-
tial” (CHS 2003:4).

A new doctrine for the implementation of the European Security Strategy, namely, the 
report entitled A Human Security Doctrine for Europe focuses on the capabilities re-
quired to address situations of severe physical insecurity, specifically ‘freedom from 
fear’, rather than on the full range of possibilities and instruments of the European 
foreign and security policies (2004:5). In the new global context, the security policy 
of the European Union should be based on human security, and not solely on state se-
curity. It is important here to distinguish between the concepts of human security and 
national security, as femicide is closely related to both, despite the fact that they are 
different objects of reference. According to the definition of the United Nations De-
velopment Programme (UNDP), the protection of individuals and communities, in-
cluding the safeguarding of female lives in case of femicide, “secures their personal 
security which is an integral part of human security as a whole” (UNDP, 1994:84). 
On the other hand, it is the state, its integrity, sovereignty and stability that are pro-
tected under the national security concept. Acting with due diligence, the state has 
a duty to ensure protection of the overall human security domain (Dulić, 2006. as cit-
ed in Oberleitner, 2003). In other words, the state has an obligation to minimise all risk 
factors potentially leading to femicide by implementing its policies (Kovačević, 2019).

According to the Council of Europe Convention on Preventing and Combating Vio-
lence against Women and Domestic Violence (the Istanbul Convention), gender-based 
violence against women means violence that is directed against a woman because she 
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is a woman or that affects women disproportionately (Konstantinović-Vilić, Petrušić, 
2021:16). Violence against women is understood as a violation of human rights and 
a form of discrimination against women and shall mean all acts of gender-based vi-
olence that result in, or are likely to result in, physical, sexual, psychological or eco-
nomic harm or suffering to women, including threats of such acts, coercion or arbi-
trary deprivation of liberty, whether occurring in public or in private life. 

Additionally, gender-based violence is a phenomenon deeply rooted in gender ine-
qualities, and is reflected primarily in disproportionate power of women and men in 
society, both in the public sphere (politics, economy) and in the sphere of private, 
intimate and family relations (Pešić, 2006). When speaking about our tradition and 
the traditions of other countries in the Western Balkans, it is evident that there was a 
major influence of the Ottoman culture, which contributed to prevalence of this ine-
quality of power between men and women in our patriarchal culture. This created an 
environment characterised by male dominance, in which gender-based violence, in-
cluding domestic violence, is a manifestation of this power within the community; 
the prevailing value models in this environment often tolerate, if not support, these 
manifestations of inequality. 

Man attains a superior position over woman in an environment where he is perceived 
as a symbol of strength and power and only secondarily as the pillar and support of a 
small community, such as family. This clearly does not reflect an equal relationship 
in terms of gender. Man is still believed to have a duty of providing all of life’s ne-
cessities, with family security being top priority. Therefore, it is no wonder that in 
Serbia, approximately 50% of households own firearms, both legal and illegal (Bek-
er, Vilić 2022). This phenomenon is frequently explained as a consequence of war or 
as a traditional contribution to family security, which assertion is not corroborated by 
research. On the contrary, the research has not shown that firearm possession in one’s 
home reduces the risk of potential threats. However, there is a shift, albeit very slow, 
towards the acceptance of values resulting from modernity, making the transforma-
tion of the system more difficult and uncertain. The once influential historical factors 
and the present character of social relations produce opposite effects, creating an im-
balance between the spheres of the normative order and the protected values (Pešić, 
2006). Therefore, it is essential to explain femicide so that every individual under-
stands that it is an issue facing the entire society and that it still escapes normative 
definition but nonetheless affects human (ill)well-being. 

In a society where the consequences of war are still visible, the firearm possession 
is explained as an act of security rather than a risk factor for escalation of violence. 
Also, femicide is usually not a single act of violence that occurs suddenly or unex-
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pectedly. Quite opposite, it is a culmination of prolonged violence, escalating from 
discrimination to abuse, perpetrated by a man against a woman. Therefore, femicide 
is a complex social phenomenon that calls for a multidisciplinary approach and ef-
forts of all community members so that the numbers of victims indicated in the avail-
able annual reports would finally start to decline (Spasić, Tadić, 2017).

The error lies in the fact that this phenomenon is the least examined through the gen-
der-specific lens and is often equated with other known forms of violence and vio-
lent behaviours. Conflicts of responsibilities among relevant authorities, unequal en-
gagement of stakeholders and lack of adequate assistance to families in coping with 
post-traumatic conditions they later experience are still persisting. Violence is vio-
lence and it is not justifiable regardless of the circumstances, as the abuser always 
has a choice, i.e. can decide not to commit violence. Further efforts should be made 
to deepen psychological, sociological and legal approaches to better understand why 
the femicide rate remains high despite progress in gender equality. 

THE FEMICIDE TRENDS IN THE PAST TWO DECADES: 
COMPARATIVE ANALYSIS OF REPORTS 

Annual analyses and final reports of the results are essential for research and monitor-
ing of femicide developments. Comparative analysis of reports from different years 
can be beneficial in forecasting future results and, thus, help to improve prevention 
measures. In regards to femicide studies in this country, they indicate lack of govern-
ment-commissioned analyses of this phenomenon and a scarcity of official and pub-
licly accessible data on existing cases (Konstantinović-Vilić, Petrušić, 2021).

For the purposes of a comparative review, the data from three reports, dating from 
three different periods and prepared by Vedrana Lacmanović for the Women against 
Violence network are considered below:

•	 	Femicide – Killings of Women in Serbia, Quantitative and narrative 
annual report for 2010 (Lacmanović, 2011).

•	 	Femicide – Killings of Women in Serbia, Quantitative and narrative re-
port January 1, 2020 – December 31, 2020 (Lacmanović, 2021).

•	 	Femicide – Killings of Women in Serbia, Quantitative and narrative re-
port January 1, 2022 – June 30, 2022 (Lacmanović, 2022a).
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Complete data covering the entire year is given in the reports for 2011 and 2021, 
whereas the last year’s report shows semi-annual data for the period from January 1, 
2022 through June 30, 2022. Only the data that is found in all three reports and rel-
evant to this paper was taken into account, while the other data has been considered 
and is presented in the remainder of the paper. It should be noted that the availabili-
ty of research data was limited at the time when it was collected from the media and 
through relevant authorities and that there may be cases that remained unknown to 
the general public. Highly likely, the data was more difficult to obtain in 2010 due to 
lack of acknowledgment of this phenomenon or due to reluctance on the side of data 
handlers. As a result, not only has the number of cases failed to decline, but quite an 
opposite, a moderate increase in the next period can be foreseen.

According to the above studies, in 2010, 30 women were killed in Serbia: 26 with-
in the family/relationship setting and 4 outside of it, whereas, in 2020, there were 44 
deaths of adult females: 26 femicides occurred within the family/relationship setting 
and others outside of this setting. The relevant data indicates that the total number of 
female killings has increased during this decade-long period, while the number of 
femicides committed in the family/relationship setting has not changed. The results 
of the annual studies indicate that a large number of abusers committed suicide af-
ter killing a female. This occurred in as many as 38.46 % of cases in 2010, while in 
2020, half of perpetrators either committed or attempted suicide following femicide. 
While the profiles of abusers vary, the above reports suggest that the majority of the 
killings were carried out by a current or former partner, which is followed by cases 
involving a spouse or former spouse.

The data that does not affect the conclusions and that remained unchanged in this 
decade-long period refers to:

•	 Place of killing 

The fact that most women were killed, as indicated in both reports, in 
the space they shared with their abusers shatters the prejudice about home 
as a place of love, protection and safety. Considering that most violent acts 
occur within the confines of one’s home, ‘home’ could become synony-
mous with a place of suffering for women who endure violence. 

•	 Relationship with the victim 

The reports consider the data indicating the circumstances in which women were 
killed. Namely, as many as 38.46% of the 26 femicides in the family/relationship set-
ting in 2010 were committed with the use of firearms. After ten years, a decline of 
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7.66 percent was marked in the number of femicides committed with the use of fire-
arms or explosive devices (one case). Nonetheless, the fact that a firearm was one 
of the most commonly used murder weapons remained unchanged. The highest and 
the lowest shares of firearm deaths in the total number of femicides were reported in 
2015 and 2018, respectively (45.71% versus 20%) (Lacmanović, Pavlov, 2023:11). 
The share of firearm femicides followed by suicide was the highest in 2017 (57.69%) 
and the lowest in 2016 (18.16%) (Lacmanović, Pavlov, 2023:11). The most common-
ly used firearm was a handgun. In respect to the legality of firearms, according to the 
data of the relevant authorities, the perpetrators were in legal possession of the fire-
arm in 37.5% of the cases, one in four cases involved the use of an illegal firearm or 
a firearm of unknown origin, and the data is lacking for the same number of cases 
(Lacmanović, 2022b). 

Firearm femicides connect two issues facing Serbia – female killings and the quan-
tity of privately owned firearms. Common to these two issues is the fact that they 
are deeply rooted in the social structure of this country and fit in traditional narra-
tives. The primary purpose of violence against women was the demonstration of male 
superiority, which was normalised as a frequent occurrence until recently, especially 
in small communities. The presence and accessibility of firearms and their misuse in 
violence against women pose an additional threat, increasing the likelihood of fatal 
outcome of violence. Furthermore, mere knowledge that an abuser possesses a fire-
arm instils fear in the victim, making them hesitant to report acts of violence, and 
makes intervention and support by witnesses of violence more difficult (Lacmano-
vić, Pavlov 2023:6). 

The societies worldwide are required to make urgent changes on two levels that in-
volve transition “from an exclusive emphasis on territorial security to a much strong-
er emphasis on human security, and from security provided by weapons to securi-
ty achieved by sustainable human development,” as described by the UNDP (Boyle, 
Simonsen 2006:132-133). The risk of femicide in this country could be reduced by 
regulating private ownership of firearms and many initiatives, regulations and legal 
amendments have been launched to that end. Naturally, in order to achieve observa-
ble results, the entire society needs to work towards implementing new regulations, 
while ensuring full respect of the human rights system, particularly in relation to the 
concept of human security. Considering that the concept of human security encom-
passes practically all types of violence, including femicide, reducing risk factors for 
femicide would enhance the factors contributing to an individual’s feeling of safety 
within community. 
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CONCLUSION 

The primary conclusion of the review of the reports is that the number of femicides is 
not declining. All characteristics of femicide still persist and there is a risk that a new 
case may occur any day. While the issue of gender-based violence is recognised to 
exist, the full awareness of its significance and impact on the community seems to be 
lacking. At the same time, one should not lose sight of the fact that the issue of vio-
lence against women primarily concerns the established unwanted behaviour patterns 
and that only a shift in the social narrative and perspective can raise awareness about 
this issue and support the efforts of relevant authorities and professionals responsible 
for ensuring the individual and community safety. In the context of responsible indi-
viduals, every person assumes this role as femicide is an issue affecting society as a 
whole. Only through joint efforts can progress be achieved and further gender-based 
violence prevented, thus safeguarding human rights, while respecting the concept of 
human security.
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Abstract: Femicide is the killing of women by men, motivated by misogyny. Analy-
ses conducted to date reveal that home is the most dangerous place for women, killed 
by their partners or family members, with 137 women being killed globally on a dai-
ly basis in such circumstances in 2017. Femicide very rarely occurs suddenly and 
without premeditation and is usually preceded by other degrees of domestic violence. 
Possession of light weapons is one of the key risks in a violence-ridden relationship, 
drastically increasing chances of femicide. Apart from the obvious risks related to 
these weapons, there is a deep cultural link between the cult of the gun and the no-
tion of a woman as a man’s property. The weak institutional frameworks governing 
these issues and the way in which the media inform society about such cases uphold 
the tradition of patriarchy still further, disencouraging women to report violence and 
potentially save themselves from abusers. 

Key words: femicide, weapons, violence, gender, women

	 * tijanabauer00@gmail.com



22 Human Security for the 21st Century - Collection of students’ papers

INTRODUCTION: CONCEPT AND RELEVANCE OF 
FEMICIDE

The term femicide was defined in the 1970s as “the murders carried out by men mo-
tivated by a sense of superiority over women, by pleasure or sadistic desires towards 
women, or by the assumption of ownership over women” (De Vido, Sosa, 2021: 159). 
Today, femicide refers to gender-based killings perpetrated by males, with the vic-
tim’s gender i.e. the fact that the victim is a woman being the crucial factor for the 
perpetrator (Spasić, Tadić, 2017: 11). The importance of the term does not just lie in 
the accurate definition of homicide targeting women but also in drawing attention to 
other forms of violence against women, including physical, emotional, sexual and 
any other form of violence which can lead to femicide. Moreover, a major aspect of 
terminological accuracy lies also in the recognition of social and historical oppres-
sion of women as well as the opportunities for improving their status in society (De 
Vido, Sosa, 2021: 159).

Due to the age-long tradition of patriarchy not treating women as equal human be-
ings, domestic violence and violence against women were considered as private mat-
ters in the past, something a state should not concern itself with. However, the aware-
ness that these issues nevertheless fall into the sphere of human rights, representing 
the problem facing the entire society, because they are part of inalienable freedoms, 
the right to life and the right to security of person, has grown over time (Tahirović, 
Radulović, 2021: 93). Even though some headway has been made with respect to 
women’s safety, especially in the theoretical sphere, gender-based violence remains 
a major issue facing the entire society. The alarming statistics point to this. In 2017 
alone, 87,000 women were killed worldwide, wih more than half of them being killed 
by intimate partners or family members, which means that during that year 137 wom-
en were killed on average every day by someone they trusted (UNODC, 2019: 10). 
While men are primary victims and perpetrators of global-level homicides in gener-
al, women account for 82% of the victims of domestic and intimate partner homi-
cides (Monckton Smith, 2020: 1267). Over the past decade, more than 300 femicides 
have been committed in Serbia (Ćurčić, Tomić, 2023), with some studies suggesting 
that one in two or one in three women will at some point become the victims of psy-
chological or physical violence committed by someone close to them (Lacmanovic, 
2021: 60). These figures provide just an outline of victims of the final stage of vio-
lence against women, not including a much higher number of women experiencing 
‘lower-level’ violence. The patriarchal notion of inequality between women and men, 
convincing men still further that they have the right to be the masters of their wives’ 
lives, lies at the bottom of this problem (Danaj, 2021: 14). Moreover, it should be not-
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ed that studies conducted to date suggest that, in the majority of cases, intimate part-
ner femicide is not a crime committed suddenly but the culmination of the abuse per-
petrated up to that point (De Vido, Sosa, 2021: 160).

This paper focuses on what lies behind intimitate partner femicide, the primary risks 
leading to it and the way in which society and law perceive this problem. One section 
of the paper deals with the issue of violence against and control over women at glob-
al level to demonstrate that this is a universal problem of patriarchal societies. The 
paper next focuses on the situation in the Republic of Serbia and the region in order 
to show how patriarchal tradition impacts their societies. 

Drawing on previously written scholarly papers and conducted studies, the paper also 
aims to shed light on the connection between violence against women and small arms 
control, as well as the culture of masculine domination underlying both problems. 
The previously conducted studies have been selected as suitable reference material 
for this paper primarily because they span different geographic areas, showing that 
femicide is a global problem. Based on the analysis of the selected texts and studies, 
I have reached the conclusion that the proliferation of small arms is an additional risk 
not only to women but also to society in general. However, the aim of this paper is to 
focus on women’s safety and status, touching additionally on the issue which, despite 
its being increasingly in focus lately, has not been solved yet. Finally, the paper’s aim 
is to provide a critical analysis of all problems listed above and draw attention to their 
causes as well as consequences and the way in which society can cope with them.

Cultural and psychological aspect of femicide 

In the analyses of femicide, especially intimate partner femicide, conducted to date, 
two most dominant discourses can be singled out: the one claiming that coersive con-
trol directed at women leads to homicide and the other which mainly perceives femi-
cide as a ‘crime of passion’. In her paper, Jane M. Smith notes that the ‘crime of pas-
sion’ concept panders to patriarchal tradition, disregarding the notion of women being 
subservient to men, and analyses eight stages of control in relationships ultimately 
leading to homicide. These eight stages include the following: pre-relationship, early 
relationship, relationship, trigger events, escalation, decision-making, planning and 
homicide. The initial stages are characterised by a seemingly idyllic relationship as 
well as unnaturally sudden intimacy. Getting into a relationship leads to the start of 
victim abuse/control: her isolation from other persons close to her, the monitoring of 
her routine, the checking of her e-mail etc. During this stage, victims often do not re-
alise what is going on or if they do realise it, they do not find it alarming, choosing 



24 Human Security for the 21st Century - Collection of students’ papers

to accept the situation rather than to heighten tensions in their relationships. Trigger 
events occur when the perpetrator starts feeling that he has lost control due to the vic-
tim’s leaving or threatening to leave, real or imaginary infidelity or common para-
noia. This stage next leads to decision-making and planning the crime based on the 
notion that the victim is the perpetrator’s property and, consequently, has no right to 
leave, which ultimately frequently ends in femicide. (Smith, 2020: 1270-1280). Ad-
ditional research has revealed that the victim’s partner’s pathological jealousy, based 
mainly on non-existent evidence, is precisely one of the main reasons for the commit-
ted femicide (Aldridge, Browne, 2003: 270). Although it is mainly women who are 
presented as jealous and possessive in society, this research offers an interesting in-
sight into how different genders are presented in everyday life and the reasons for it.

Focusing on the pattern which can often be applied to intimate partner violence cases 
is important so that society could further accept the fact that violence against women 
is not only perpetrated by men suffering from some mental illness, men addicted to 
pshycoactive substances or some ‘monsters’ as they are often depicted by the media, 
but also by men taught to treat women as being less worthy than they are or in a way 
suggesting ownership (Danaj, 2021:14). 

A multi-country study, conducted also in Serbia, further supports this thesis, show-
ing that the majority of men who abused women in their lives in any way also fall 
under the behavioural pattern involving a high degree of partner controlling. In ad-
dition, the study’s empirical results revealed that women were in fact most at risk in 
their own homes (Garcia-Moreno et al., 2006: 1265-1268). Moreover, the men’s un-
employment resulted in an increase in intimate partner violence, while the women’s 
unemployment had the opposite effect (Peterman et al., 2020: 7-9). Although patriar-
chal culture portrays a man as the pillar of the family, job insecurity evidently makes 
him feel that he is losing control, while a woman’s better material status undermines 
his position in society and makes it easier for her to leave him. On the other hand, if 
a woman is unemployed, she is more easily controlled. 

Another type of intimate partner femicide includes the killings of women by their fa-
thers, brothers or distant relatives in order to preserve family honour. There are sev-
eral situations which can lead to it such as women’s extramarital relationships, extra-
marital births or even the fact that one of the women or girls in the family has been 
raped (UNODC, 2019: 30-31). Again, the notion underlying such relationships is that 
a woman is not free to decide about her life or to be a sexual being and, as she can no 
longer be controlled, she is a disgrace to her family. 

Follow-up analyses have aimed to identify the most common life circumstances 
which are the main risks of abuse and or/femicide in a relationship, apart from the 
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perpetrator’s personality. They include the following: unemployment, level of qual-
ifications, alcohol or drug abuse, cohabitation with the victim, cohabitation with the 
victim’s child and the fact whether the perpetrator possesses any weapons. The find-
ings of the analyses have revealed that, if the partner has a weapon, the risk of hom-
icide is drastically higher, except in situations in which the victim has never lived 
with her partner, in which case it is slightly lower. Previous threats with a weapon or 
threats to kill have had even more drastic impact on the risk of femicide. The find-
ings have shown that the seizure of a weapon from the perpetrator of gender-based 
violence is one of the key ways of preventing a potential femicide (Campbell et al., 
2003: 1090-1093). Although a very small number of countries maintain datasets on 
firearm possession with gender-disaggregated statistics, those which do show that 
men possess most of the weapons (Frate et al., 2020: 3-5). Although the countries 
with high crime rates feature at the top of femicide ranking, it is suprising that some 
countries, primarily in Europe, have high femicide rates despite low crime rates. 
Nevertheless, on average, small arms were used in one third of femicides worldwide 
(Nowak, 2012: 1-4). The proliferation of light weapons and the men’s pathological 
need to control women have the same roots, supporting each other, especially in re-
gions such as the Western Balkans. 

Connection between femicide and small arms 

What makes small arms and light weapons different from other weapons is the very 
fact that, of about 875 million pieces of this type of weapons, more than 75% is in 
the possession of individuals or non-state structures, according to a study conduct-
ed in 2017 (Spasić, Tadić, 2017: 13-14). This is further compounded by the fact that 
the majority of homicides were committed by this very type of weapons, legally 
owned by perpetrators. Even though this is a global issue, it has its special foothold 
in the Balkans, especially in the countries which emerged from former Yugoslavia. 
Apart from legally-owned weapons appearing in mass circulation, illegal weapons, 
the quantity of which it is hard to establish, are also a problem. One of the reasons 
for it are the wars waged in the region, especially in the 1990s, leaving weaponry in 
their wake. The poor rule of law, the unfinished security sector reform, strong crimi-
nal structures and the emotional and psychological war legacy have only exacerbated 
the small arms problem in the region (Spasić, Tadić, 2017: 13-14).

Still, despite the evident risk to which women are exposed with weapons in the home, 
the cultural aspect connecting femicide and light weapons possession should be men-
tioned as well. The Western Balkans is a region in which the cult of the gun is still 
strongly present, permeating the people’s everyday life, which includes its symbol-
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ic role during celebrations or in times of grieving (Spasić, Tadić, 2017: 14-26). Gun 
possession is associated with the idea of a strong traditional man, who in this way fur-
ther asserts and proves his masculinity and dominance over other members of socie-
ty, especially women, to himself and society in general. Guns are associated with the 
image of a man capable of not only protecting his property but also posing a threat 
to other people’s property. However, despite the obvious set of issues related to this 
phenomenon, there is another one, namely men governed by this traditionally pa-
triarchal ideology often treat women as their property. As highlighted by the obser-
vations made in the above analyses and papers, a man’s need to control a woman is 
one of the principal reasons of femicide. If this image of a woman as a man’s prop-
erty is put into context with the cult of a traditional man who finds his strength in a 
handgun or another such weapon, it comes as no surprise that about 40% of femi-
cides were indeed perpetrated by firearms (Spasić, Tadić, 2017: 25). When analysing 
the culture manifesting itself in this way, one should bear in mind that, historically, a 
woman was legally as well as mentally perceived as a man’s property until recently 
and, consequently, she had no right to leave her marriage or relationship of her own 
free will (Johnson et al., 2017: 7). Due to all that, it comes as no surprise that domes-
tic violence was regulated by law and penalised in Serbia as late as 2002 (Spasić, Ta-
dić, 2017: 34).

Institutional distrust, legislative shortcomings and failure to implement legislation 
pose yet another problem associated with both weapons possession as well as femi-
cide and violence against women. As for weapons control, a major objection to the 
current Law on Weapons and Ammunition is that the fitness to possess and carry 
weapons is checked only once in five years. One of the reasons why this could be a 
problem is that a lot can change over the course of five years, especially as regards 
a person’s mental health. Another reason is the lack of trust in both judicial as well 
as health care institutions (Spasić, Tadić, 2017: 27-29). Regrettably, it is not hard to 
imagine a situation in which a medical examination is not performed at all or is not 
properly performed, with personal gain or personal acquaintance being the sole rea-
sons for the issuing of the relevant certificate.

In addition to these objections, I would like to add that, partly due to traditional patri-
archal culture, mental health issues are highly stigmatised in the Balkans so that, this, 
too, could be the reason why some medical examinations may not have been prop-
erly conducted. Moreover, these obstacles appear only during the control of circula-
tion of legally-held weapons, without even probing into the issue of illegal weapons 
possession. Although the majority of women have been killed with weapons in legal 
possession (Spasić, Tadić, 2017: 25), illegally-held weapons present yet another chal-
lenge in the fight against this situation. The initiative to hand in illegally-held weap-
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ons stands out among the most recent efforts of the Government of the Republic of 
Serbia to do something about the problem. The initiative was launched following the 
tragic events which hit Belgrade and Serbia in May 2023. It resulted in the surrender 
of large quantities of different weapons, however, this is by no means an end to ef-
forts to combat the problem (Glavonjić, 2023).

Moreover, legislative shortcomings and institutional distrust have a bearing on re-
ports of domestic violence and society’s response to and prosecution of femicide as 
well. In 2019, 26 femicide cases were registered in Serbia, while in 2020 the num-
ber of confirmed victims remained the same, with five other women being suspected 
femicide victims. The problem of femicide victim registration in Serbia, as in most 
countries which do not have a separate law defining gender-based homicide, is that 
institutions have no victim classifications or data, so that media reports are the basic 
source of information. Still, analyses to date suggest that, in the past few years, one 
in three killed women did indeed first contact some relevant institution to report vi-
olence, while today only one in seven women report it. Regrettably, this information 
primarily shows that the main reason for it is the growing belief that reports to insti-
tutions will not help solve the problem, while at the same time they may infuriate the 
perpetrator still further (Tahirović, Radulović, 2021: 95).

The factors lying behind this may primarily be found in the idea of the ‘perfect vic-
tim’ launched in society. This idea depicts a woman who is the victim of violence 
as a seriously injured, tormented and blameless person, who could in no way have 
provoked the abuser with any of her actions. The social, academic and institutional 
frameworks introduced this discourse at the point when domestic violence was first 
shifted to the public sphere in order to win sympathy for women who are victims of 
violence and serve justice more easily. However, even though initial intentions were 
just, the idea is still present today, doing more harm than good to women. Fearing that 
they may not be able to fit the narrow and hard-to-prove image of the victim, wom-
en think that society and institutions will not believe them and, consequently, do not 
try to seek help. Moreover, as a result, even the victims themselves do not consid-
er low-level violence as violence or they do not believe that they can be protected 
from it. This type of violence includes low-level physical violence such as an ‘occa-
sional slap’ or mental abuse, degradation, stalking and control (Johnson et al., 2017: 
7-8). Another reason why women, especially those living in the Balkans, decide not 
to contact insitutions, specifically in small towns, is their experience of officials from 
these institutions, such as police officers, taking the abuser’s side or believing that 
this is a family matter or, in some situations, even helping or encouraging the abuser 
to continue the abuse (Spasić, Tadić, 2017: 50-54).
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The situation in Serbia is further compounded by the media, which report on femicide 
cases in a sensation-mongering way, disregarding the very essence of the problem. 
They look for motives for the perpetrator’s act, focusing on comments on his person-
ality and shifting the blame to his victim in a way (Tahirović, Radulović, 2021: 96). 
On top of that, some media content, such as reality shows, presents violence and the 
cult of the gun as something acceptable, even desirable, featuring different scenes and 
types of abuse of women for the purpose of entertainment (Lacmanovic, 2021: 63).

Although only a small number of countries recognise femicide as a separate type of 
crime, some EU member states, such as France and Greece, have made initial efforts 
to address the issue, recognising the fact that being a female can prove in some cas-
es to be the decisive factor in the committed crime (De Vido, Sosa, 2021: 164-165). 
The Republic of Croatia has also announced that it will not only tighten sentences 
for criminal offences like rape or violence against women but will also introduce the 
term femicide into its justice system (VoxFeminae, 2023). It is a truly devastating fact 
that while such steps are taken in the EU, in the countries which are Serbia’s neigh-
bours, the Serbian justice system does not treat these crimes as grave murder in cop-
ing with femicide, pronouncing less severe sentences on such grounds as the perpe-
trator being a father of two children, whose mother he has killed. Sometimes these 
crimes are tried as domestic violence accidentally ending in homicide, which is also 
a mitigating circumstance and may result in a reduced sentence for the perpetrator 
(Ćurčić, Tomić, 2023).
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CONCLUSION 

Even though the above analysis, which is the subject of this paper, has demonstrated 
that the possession of small arms and light weapons poses a great risk to women in 
intimate relationships, it is just one of a series of side effects of the problems having 
much deeper roots. Stricter regulation of gun possession and a better institutional re-
sponse to the issue would by all means help increase women’s safety. However, they 
would not eliminate the main problem and the main threat to women. 

As stated above, the need to control women which may lead to femicide and the cult 
of the gun have the same roots, which lie in the patriarchal notion of the tradition-
al role of a man, who is always more dominant than a woman. Moreover, social and 
sometimes even institutional refusal to shift domestic violence entirely from the pri-
vate sphere to the public sphere places women in an even more vulnerable position. 
The legal interpretation of these crimes as ‘crimes of passion’ disregards all that ly-
ing behind the event culminating in femicide. Also, finding mitigating circumstanc-
es which may result in a reduced sentence for the perpetrator signals that women 
will not get any protection or justice even once they are dead. The media coverage of 
these crimes further discourages the victims to perceive themselves as victims in the 
first place and seek help, because it might just happen that the news that a woman was 
“killed for reporting violence” appears in the newspapers. 

The conclusion reached within the confines of this paper is that the effective reso-
lution of this problem will be possible only once society has become fully aware of 
these issues. Even though various initiatives by non-governmental organisations and 
academia have managed to put the spotlight on them, it is necessary to develop this 
topic still further and break the stereotypes based on decades of misinterpreted be-
liefs and tradition. Moreover, it is vital to ensure the involvement of official institu-
tions and authorities in addressing these issues and do something about the way in 
which the media report on domestic violence and femicide. One of the ways to do it 
would doubtless be to introduce femicide into the Serbian Criminal Code or at least 
to treat it as a serious crime. The best approach to the improvement of women’s sta-
tus in society and their exercise of the right to life and integrity is education. The ed-
ucation of broader social strata and in particular younger generations and a serious 
institutional approach to problems of this kind would render possible preventive ac-
tion aiming to discourage potential perpetrators. Without that, focusing on the role of 
firearms in the perpetration of these crimes will have no crucial impact on the change 
in the overall situation. 
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Abstract:In May 2023, Serbia was shocked by the news of a mass killing at a prima-
ry school in Belgrade, committed by one of its students. The news of killings in the 
world are often met with disbelief, but what is specific for this case is that the Serbi-
an public has never before been in a position to witness the misuse of firearms in ed-
ucational institutions. Consequently, it comes as no surprise that the measures in-
troduced following the incident were not designed in the best way possible. This is 
exactly what I write about in my essay. In order to help promote human security in 
the future, my paper is written in the form of a policy brief. I do that by analysing the 
actions taken after the mass killing and explain why the measures taken could have 
been better informed, taking into account previous studies conducted in the world af-
ter school killings. Consequently, although the essay is primarily based on the mass 
killing committed in Serbia, it justifies its argumentation through an interdiscipli-
nary approach which analyses media impact and disarmament with a view to im-
proving safety. This is extremely important because the misuse of firearms has a neg-
ative bearing on human security. I conclude that the media coverage of violence and 
in particular school killings has numerous effects, which are taken much too lightly. 
The essay therefore recommends public regulation of the media coverage of similar 
content. As for disarmament, the essay recognises its significance in view of prolifer-
ation of weapons in Serbia but it also calls for measures directly adapted to school 
environments, such as metal detectors and ‘zero-tolerance’ policies 
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INTRODUCTION

In May 2023, Serbia was shocked by the news of a mass killing at a primary school 
in Belgrade, committed by one of its students (N1, 2023a). The news of killings in 
the world are often met with disbelief, but what is specific for this case is that the 
Serbian public has never before been in a position to witness the misuse of firearms 
in educational institutions. Without using the uniqueness of the event as a pretext, I 
try to propose alternative solutions for the improvement of school safety in the form 
of a policy brief in response to the evaluation of the ways in which the Serbian me-
dia and authorities handled the mass killing situation. I believe that the evaluation of 
the actions is important because it can serve as a lesson should situations of this kind 
occur again as it teaches us to differentiate between good and bad approaches to the 
problem when the aim is safety. Bearing this in mind, I claim in the essay that the se-
quence of actions after the mass killing in Serbia was not thought through in the best 
way possible. As the misuse of firearms has a negative bearing on human security, I 
believe that it is of crucial importance to improve the response to it to create room for 
headway in the human security sphere. To justify my argumentation, I first introduce 
the concepts of misuse of firearms in schools and safety. I then apply the acquired 
theoretical knowledge to the case registered in Serbia, which makes it necessary to 
explain the event and the actions taken in its wake. This allows me to identify poten-
tial areas of improvement primarily based on the media coverage of violent incidents, 
such as this one, and the disarmament campaign in Serbia with a view to preventing 
attempts to bring guns to schools again. 

Theoretical approach: the misuse of firearms in schools and safety 

To explain the significance of the problem and the need for a response, the first step 
is to understand the problem. I therefore start this essay with an introduction into the 
proliferation and misuse of firearms, focusing primarily on the school system and 
the connection with safety in a school environment. Small arms and light weapons 
(SALW) is the term used for “conventional weapons which are relatively cheap, eas-
ily available and simple to use and maintain” (Kotlarić, Joksimović, 2015, p.252). 
The problem of small arms and light weapons starts with their proliferation. Speak-
ing in figures, two thirds of 850 million small arms and light weapons in the world 
are in private possession, mainly in homes (Spasić, Radovanović, 2019). In the West-
ern Balkans, Serbia included, the proliferation of firearms is a big problem for society 
(Stojanović, Šekarić, 2019). To put this into perspective, the number of firearms per 
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capita in Serbia exceeds 39, which puts it in fifth place on the list of countries with 
the highest number of civilian-held weapons per capita (Small Arms Survey, 2017). 
According to Kotlarić and Joksimović (2015), small arms and light weapons are used 
in most of the armed conflicts. Consequently, the problem of small arms prolifera-
tion arises from its implications manifesting themselves as criminal activity (Stojano-
vić, Šekarić, 2019). As criminal activity has a negative bearing on personal safety, 
the proliferation of firearms also poses a threat to it in the long run, which will be dis-
cussed in more detail later in the essay. However, before I focus more on the concept 
of personal safety, I would like to touch on the issue of misuse of firearms in various 
environments, placing the focus on the school system. 

The misuse of firearms can occur in various places with different consequences. For 
example, some forms of firearms misuse can result in unintentional injuries as well as 
violence in the form of domestic violence, mass killings, school shootings and even 
terrorism (Allely, 2020). Consequently, in addition to the authorities, the issue of fire-
arms misuse should be addressed by the health care system with the focus on men-
tal health, as well as criminology and criminal justice (Rivara, Kellermann, 2007) in 
order to solve it. Due to its extensiveness, it is not possible to find a solution which 
could have a full effect on all aspects of firearms misuse. Consequently, this para-
graph primarily focuses on firearms misuse in school systems. The reason for is that, 
over the past 25 years, the ‘trend’ of firearm misuse has been registered across the 
world, primarily in the United States (Böckler et al., 2013). As for mass shootings, 
in 2023, 476 cases were registered by August 28 alone (BBC, 2023). For each of the 
last three calendar years there have been over 600 mass shootings, which is some-
thing unprecedented. In view of the fact that this paper deals with the improvement 
of safety in school systems, it is important to understand what lies behind the issue. 
It should be primarily mentioned that there is no uniform official definition explain-
ing or conceptualising a school shooting. The problem primarily arises because dif-
ferent systems define the issue in different ways (Böckler et al., 2013). Consequent-
ly, the justice system, for example, treats firearms misuse in schools differently from 
health care workers and psychologists. Böckler et al. (2013) explain that, for this rea-
son, these systems interpret the misuse phenomenon in different ways, namely as a 
result of sociocultural influences, the lack of policies or the pathological structure 
of personality. Since this makes research into the issue and potential solutions even 
more difficult, I have decided to place the focus of my paper on the broad general 
definition of the term ‘school shooting’ as the killing of one or frequently more vic-
tims with firearms in a school environment (Kelley, May, 2011). Having a clearly-de-
fined problem provides a starting point in the search for a solution and, consequently, 
even though firearems misuse in school systems can be analysed in different ways, I 
can offer a solution while recognising the extensiveness of the problem. 
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As mentioned above, firearms misuse has negative impact on human security. In its 
broadest sense, human security can be explained as the protection of an individual’s 
security through the absence of direct or indirect threats in the broadest sense (UNDP, 
1994). Under the definition, threats to human security can be highly diverse, includ-
ing natural disasters, violent conflicts, impoverishment, health pandemics, terrorism, 
economic disasters etc. (UNOCHA, 2009). From that perspective, it is clear that fire-
arms misuse is doubtless a threat to human security. When you add to it a rise in the 
misuse, especially in cases involving school systems, the situation assumes alarm-
ing proportions, because it is harder to maintain safety. Consequently, by defining the 
given problem, firearms misuse and its impact on safety, I try to help improve the rel-
evant school safety policy. To do this based on a specific case, I have decided to fo-
cus on the incident which took place at the primary school in Belgrade. The previous 
chapter can therefore serve as a starting point in understanding the concepts the study 
will further deal with. Once I have introduced the specific case in the next chapter, 
the definition of the problem will allow me to evaluate safety maintenance policies 
and make my modest proposals. 

Study of the case which took place in Serbia 

In this chapter, I try to shed more light on the case of firearms misuse resulting in the 
mass killing at the primary school in Belgrade. I will first explain what happened on 
the day of the incident and will then look into what happened after the incident with a 
view to maintaining safety, including the actions taken immediately after it and long-
term goals. Namely, the incident occurred when an underage student opened fire with 
handguns at the Belgrade primary school on May 3, killing eight fellow-students 
and a security guard (N1, 2023a). He also wounded six more children and a teacher. 
It all happened in the early hours of the morning, about 8.40 a.m. and just after les-
sons began (N1, 2023a). After the incident, the killer left the school, heading for the 
schoolyard, whence he called the police that found him there and took him into cus-
tody (N1, 2023b). What we know is that the student used two pistols, a 9 mm pistol 
and a small-calibre pistol, both of which belonged to his father (Blic, 2023). This in-
formation was collected and spread fast via TV news and newspaper reports even on 
the day of the incident. The issues related to this practice will be discussed in more 
detail in the next chapter of the essay. At this point, I just want to share the sources I 
used while collecting information about the incident.

The facts mentioned in the above paragraph, with additional information about the 
names of the victims and the killer and his and his family’s private life, were released 
in public by a large number of Serbian as well as foreign news desks. Public disclo-
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sure of the facts was the first thing that happened after the incident. Politicians and 
police also disclosed some information to the public while the investigation was still 
ongoing (Maja Nikolić, 2023). Moreover, as the incident took place on Wednesday 
morning, all schools were closed in Serbia on Thursday and Friday, while the nation 
was in mourning (N1, 2023v). Although I do not intend to go into more detail, be-
cause the paper focuses on school safety, another firearms misuse incident was reg-
istered less than 48 hours after the first incident (N1, 2023g). Still, even though I 
think that this approach to a mass killing, especially that committed in a school envi-
ronment, was far from ideal, the fact that the country was for the first time ever con-
fronted with this kind of problem and that the ideal way of proceeding was not part 
of common knowledge should be taken into account. Although similar incidents did 
occur in the world in the past, none of them were registered in the Republic of Serbia. 
Consequently, I would like to touch on the plans aimed at safety maintenance, made 
in the months after the incident, i.e. at the point when it was evident what the ‘ideal’ 
way of proceeding in the given situation was. 

One of the major efforts to improve safety in the months after the incident was the 
disarmament campaign, i.e. the surrender of illegal weapons, and control of the con-
ditions in which guns were kept in homes (RTS, 2023). As for the disarmament cam-
paign, the Government of the Republic of Serbia called on its citizens to hand in il-
legal guns within a month and not face any consequences. In addition, the new draft 
law provides for a prison sentence for unlawful possession of weapons and more fre-
quent checks of whether weapon-keeping requirements are met (including psychiat-
ric and psychological examination and testing for psychoactive substances), which 
will be conducted once in six to twelve months, because the security situation re-
quires the strictest measures possible (Ivković, 2023). Consequently, student safe-
ty, even over the longer term, is something that was given a lot of thought after the 
incident. Moreover, the measures were introduced to reduce potentially the chanc-
es of a similar incident occurring in the future. Admittly, only from the disarmament 
perspective, to make its perpetration physically more difficult. In the next chapter of 
the essay, I seek to improve this approach to firearms misuse, using scholarly litera-
ture based on previous cases which are similar. Consequently, I place my focus not 
only on disarmament but also on other approaches promoting safety and reducing the 
chances of recurrence of such incidents.

How to learn from mistakes related to safety improvement 

Given that the previous chapter deals with the attempts to improve safety made in 
Serbia after the incident, in this chapter I look more deeply into the actions taken in 
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its wake, comparing them to the proposals which were tested and which proved to be 
successful in the past. Consequently, I focus on the media coverage of the incident 
and the disarmament campaign, i.e. stricter requirements for holding weapons, and 
their link to safety. 

Media coverage of the incident 

The studies conducted support the thesis that the media coverage of school shootings 
is watched far more often than the coverage of other violent news (Maguire et al., 
2017). Consequently, the news of the Belgrade primary school incident, too, reached 
the public in record time. Within 30 minutes of the incident, reporters were crowding 
in front of the school and the news appeared on the websites of media outlets (N1, 
2023a). Despite this high media coverage, it is a well-known fact that interviewing 
victims exposed to trauma, which in this case includes all present in the school as 
well as their nearest, can have greater effects on posttraumatic stress symptoms than 
in victims who are not interviewed (Haravouri et al., 2011). Bearing this in mind, as 
well as the post-incident developments, it is evident that different steps could have 
been taken in the given situation, with less severe consequences for the victims. Gen-
tile et al. (2007) provide a comprehensive study of media violence policies, focusing 
primarily on children. To avoid repetition, I would like to focus primarily on the idea 
of co-regulation (pp. 51-53). According to this idea, the best approach to policies on 
violent content coverage is the combination of public regulation of the content and 
self-regulation of the level of exposure to it. What I see as a shortcoming of these 
policies is that they do not focus on the media coverage of school shootings. It is im-
portant to note that the way in which school shootings are covered affects the way in 
which the readers respond to an incident. Consequently, rage and, as a result, more 
violence can be triggered (O’Toole & Fondacaro, 2017) as well as public fear (Burns 
& Crawford, 1999; Newman et al., 2004). Rocque (2012) also explains that the me-
dia often present school shootings in an overdramatic way. Whether the policies can 
treat the coverage of this type of violence in the same way as the coverage of other 
types of violence should be therefore open to debate.

Although causing fear is problematic in itself, there are much greater consequences 
if media coverage triggers the chain of events resulting in other similar incidents in 
the future. Gentile et al. (2007) have studied media impact and its potential to trig-
ger the desire to copycat, explained by social learning theory and model-based learn-
ing. According to this theory, personal behaviour and personality traits are adopted 
by observing behavioural models, as explained by Bandura and Walters (1977). Con-
sequently, in practice this means that, by observing school shooting incidents, oth-
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ers can be inspired to imitate such behaviours. In this case, the possibility to copycat 
can be reflected in a higher number of gun misuse incidents and higher incidence of 
school violence. For example, less than two days after the incident in the Belgrade 
primary school, another gun misuse incident was registered in Serbia (N1, 2023). I 
admit that more research is needed to establish the correlation between the two inci-
dents, still it is evident that both of them occurred in a very short interval of time. It is 
also evident that no attempt was made to regulate the media and their coverage of vi-
olence at the time when the incidents occurred. I therefore suggest the introduction of 
policies governing the media coverage of violent incidents as a better approach when 
aiming to reduce the incidence of violence and improve the people’s safety. 

Disarmament and stricter gun-holding requirements 

In the previous paragraph, I have touched on the policies preventing recurrent gun 
misuse that one frequently comes across. Given that this is the most common way of 
introducing policies after major gun misuse incidents and that similar policies were 
introduced in the studied case on which this paper is based, I would like to look deep-
er into previous studies on the subject and make a comment on it. Popular argumen-
tation suggests that the first step in preventing recurrent school shootings is reducing 
the opportunity for violence (Rocque, 2012). This primarily refers to policies con-
trolling access to guns and promoting school safety. Consequently, policies recom-
mending the hiring of security guards and installation of metal detectors and video 
surveillance systems are quite common, as well as ‘zero-tolerance’ policies mandat-
ing immediate suspension of students who bring weapons to schools (Rocque, 2012; 
Trump, 2000). Still, it should be noted that there are no evaluation processes for the 
given policies, i.e that the efficacy of the policies as such has not been tested. Roc-
que (2012) argues that it is extremely difficult to evaluate the policies simply because 
school shootings are rare occurrences. Consequently, due to the small number of 
school shooting incidents, it is hard to determine the policy impact on them. As a re-
sult, the question of whether incidents of firearms misuse in schools should be treated 
as a unique subtype of violence or whether the general information on violence and 
introduction of violence prevention policies can be applied to school shootings re-
mains open. As in the case of the media coverage of school shootings, I come across 
the problem having to do with the lack of previous studies on school shooting-related 
policies. Despite that, I still believe that there is room for policy improvement in or-
der to ensure personal safety and apply that to the Belgrade primary school incident.

In the previous chapter of the paper, I have mentioned the policies introduced in Ser-
bia after the incident. The conclusion I have made is that, in Serbia, too, the main fo-
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cus was placed on the control of access to weapons. In view of the proliferation of 
weapons in Serbian homes mentioned above, campaigns to this end are more than 
welcome, even when they are unrelated to mass killing incidents. Still, what I rec-
ognise as a shortcoming is that the newly-introduced policies were neither adapted 
nor more closely linked to the school system. The surrender of illegal weapons and 
control of conditions in which they are kept are indeed ways of controlling access 
to guns in order to prevent their potential misuse in the future. However, the imple-
mentation is still not adapted to schools to prevent gun misuse in them. For example, 
the proposals made in the reference material, including the introduction of metal de-
tectors and ‘zero-tolerance’ policies can be very effective in this case. Metal detec-
tors have already been introduced in different public institutions such as courts and, 
consequently, I believe that their introduction in schools would not be so much dif-
ferent. The goal achieved in this case would be a safer learning environment and the 
students’ being less concerned while at school. I believe that it is necessary to make 
such a move, because safety was compromised precisely in such an environment in 
the given case, rather than to speak in general terms that this happened because large 
quantities of weapons were present in the country. Naturally, the shortcoming relat-
ed to not being able to conduct the evaluation remains an open issue, compounded 
by large investments resulting from these policies. Still, the paper’s focus remains on 
the theoretical approach to the improvement of school safety, while these limitations 
call for further studies on the subject. 
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CONCLUSION

In view of the mass killing incident which took place at the Belgrade primary school 
in May 2023, this essay is in the form of a policy brief with focus on personal safety, 
proposing public regulation of media violence and the restriction of guns in school 
environments. The argumention I have defended is that the Republic of Serbia’s ap-
proach to the issue was limited and superficial and, as a result, the policies imple-
mented were not at the highest level, necessary for ensuring the people’s safety after 
the incident. My arguments are backed by previous studies on school shootings, fo-
cusing primarily on the media approach to such incidents and efforts to make further 
gun misuse physically impossible. A definite limitation of this paper, which can be 
observed in both cases, is the small number of studies conducted on the subject. Con-
sequently, the paper calls for further studies on the subject to ensure a higher level of 
safety in school environments. It is extremely important to pay maximum attention to 
the issue to maintain the satisfactory level of education in the country, apart from the 
obvious importance of maintaining people’s safety. 
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